
Soyadı D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N DY N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N
RÜVEYDA CANKURTARAN 11 4 10,00 5 2 4,50 5 1 4,75 4 2 3,50 5 0 5,00 8 0 8,00 3 1 2,75 0 0 0,00 4 10 1,50 2 11 -0,75 0 0 0,00 38,50 19,25 0,75

YILMAZ YAŞAR 9 12 6,00 5 3 4,25 4 2 3,50 5 1 4,75 6 4 5,00 3 3 2,25 3 1 2,75 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 28,50 14,75 1,00

HATİCE BUSE ÖCALAN 16 4 15,00 7 2 6,50 4 0 4,00 4 0 4,00 4 2 3,50 1 1 0,75 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 33,75 26,50 1,00

ŞUAYİP İLHAN 10 5 8,75 4 2 3,50 4 2 3,50 8 3 7,25 6 4 5,00 3 0 3,00 0 2 -0,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 30,50 15,75 0,00

YUSUF AKDOĞAN 4 3 3,25 9 1 8,75 1 2 0,50 4 0 4,00 3 0 3,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 9 1 8,75 3 3 2,25 4 3 3,25 4 6 2,50 19,50 21,25 16,75

AYBÜKE COŞKUN 12 6 10,50 1 4 0,00 3 2 2,50 3 2 2,50 4 3 3,25 5 3 4,25 4 1 3,75 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 26,75 13,00 0,00

İREM YILDIZ 15 4 14,00 2 6 0,50 2 3 1,25 1 3 0,25 5 2 4,50 4 2 3,50 4 1 3,75 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 27,75 16,75 1,00

EMİRHAN OYMAK 10 5 8,75 3 7 1,25 4 2 3,50 6 4 5,00 7 4 6,00 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 3 3 2,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 25,50 15,75 2,25

AYŞE MEHLİKA ÖZTÜRK 16 2 15,50 7 1 6,75 4 2 3,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 8 2 7,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 25,75 33,25 7,50

AYŞENUR KAYAARSLAN 12 5 10,75 3 4 2,00 4 2 3,50 3 6 1,50 4 3 3,25 3 7 1,25 2 1 1,75 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 24,00 16,25 0,00

GİZEM BİNGÜL 11 4 10,00 5 3 4,25 5 0 5,00 3 2 2,50 5 1 4,75 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 1 0,75 1 12 -2,00 2 11 -0,75 0 6 -1,50 26,50 20,00 -3,50

MELEK USLUADAM 10 7 8,25 3 5 1,75 2 4 1,00 6 2 5,50 5 3 4,25 2 0 2,00 2 2 1,50 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 24,25 12,00 1,00

ZEHRA NUR ŞAHİNGÖZ 11 4 10,00 6 1 5,75 2 1 1,75 4 1 3,75 4 1 3,75 0 1 -0,25 0 1 -0,25 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 24,50 18,50 1,00

GÜLTEN CANKURTARAN 10 3 9,25 4 3 3,25 5 0 5,00 4 3 3,25 1 1 0,75 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 1 13 -2,25 2 11 -0,75 4 9 1,75 21,50 18,50 -0,25
EMİR KAAN 
KORKMAZYÜREK

13 3 12,25 3 3 2,25 4 0 4,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 13 2 12,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 18,50 31,00 12,50

MUHAMMET KOCAKAYA 0 0 0,00 2 1 1,75 2 0 2,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 13 1 12,75 3 5 1,75 5 4 4,00 6 2 5,50 3,75 16,50 24,00

HAVVANUR USLUADAM 9 3 8,25 1 4 0,00 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 3 1 2,75 2 1 1,75 9 5 7,75 0 1 -0,25 5 1 4,75 2 4 1,00 13,75 17,00 13,25

GÜL NİHAL TAŞDEMİR 10 6 8,50 3 3 2,25 4 0 4,00 4 0 4,00 3 3 2,25 2 3 1,25 1 2 0,50 2 4 1,00 1 11 -1,75 1 10 -1,50 1 12 -2,00 22,75 15,75 -4,25

ALİ ALBOSTANLI 9 3 8,25 3 6 1,50 3 2 2,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 8 3 7,25 3 3 2,25 4 3 3,25 3 6 1,50 12,25 19,50 14,25

CENNET İREM YALMAN 14 5 12,75 2 3 1,25 3 1 2,75 4 2 3,50 1 1 0,75 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 5 2 4,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 21,00 21,25 4,50

MUSTAFA FİDANCI 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 5 3 4,25 10 2 9,50 6 3 5,25 6 5 4,75 0,00 4,25 23,75

EYLÜL KURTUL 7 3 6,25 2 2 1,50 1 4 0,00 6 0 6,00 3 1 2,75 1 5 -0,25 2 0 2,00 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 18,25 8,75 1,00

YUSUF CAN OĞUZ 6 12 3,00 5 3 4,25 5 1 4,75 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 13,00 13,00 2,00

ZARİFE ÖZTÜRK 13 8 11,00 1 4 0,00 4 0 4,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 1 13 -2,25 4 9 1,75 6 7 4,25 15,00 16,00 4,75

ALİ KAAN BECEK 7 4 6,00 1 3 0,25 1 1 0,75 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 11 6 9,50 4 5 2,75 5 2 4,50 5 6 3,50 7,00 16,50 20,25

SILA AKCE 14 5 12,75 5 3 4,25 1 2 0,50 5 4 4,00 0 1 -0,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 2 1 1,75 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 21,25 19,25 1,75

NARİYE NUR UZEL 13 7 11,25 4 3 3,25 3 2 2,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 2 2 1,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 2 0 2,00 17,00 18,50 3,50

GÜLSEN ÖZYÜREK 14 3 13,25 4 0 4,00 2 3 1,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 9 2 8,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 18,50 27,00 8,50

SERKAN MURATDAĞI 12 11 9,25 4 5 2,75 4 2 3,50 1 0 1,00 1 4 0,00 0 1 -0,25 0 0 0,00 1 1 0,75 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 16,25 16,25 0,75

SUDE HANIM AYIK 11 7 9,25 2 4 1,00 4 2 3,50 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 6 2 5,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 14,75 19,25 5,50

GÜLCE NAVRUZ KARATAŞ 11 9 8,75 2 3 1,25 4 2 3,50 2 2 1,50 1 2 0,50 0 1 -0,25 0 0 0,00 1 1 0,75 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 15,25 14,25 0,75

BEDRİYE AYŞE YILDIRIM 8 5 6,75 3 2 2,50 4 2 3,50 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 13,75 13,75 1,00

ASLI PAKEL 9 9 6,75 1 5 -0,25 2 3 1,25 2 4 1,00 6 3 5,25 0 0 0,00 1 2 0,50 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 14,50 8,75 1,00
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AYŞENUR GÜRVELİK 11 5 9,75 2 4 1,00 3 2 2,50 1 2 0,50 2 2 1,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 2 3 1,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 15,25 14,50 1,25

MELİSA ÇİL 14 6 12,50 3 5 1,75 3 3 2,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 3 0,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 16,50 16,75 0,25

RUMEYSA ŞENER 15 7 13,25 2 8 0,00 3 3 2,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 5 0 5,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 15,50 20,50 5,00

MEHMET ARDA AKTEMUR 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 11 4 10,00 4 3 3,25 3 6 1,50 5 5 3,75 1,00 10,00 18,50

BEYZA BULUT 7 7 5,25 3 2 2,50 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 4 4 3,00 1 0 1,00 1 1 0,75 4 3 3,25 7,75 10,75 8,00

HALİT ARDA SEBAN 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 10 4 9,00 4 4 3,00 4 2 3,50 3 2 2,50 0,00 9,00 18,00

NİHAL FATMA ÇALIK 7 2 6,50 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 5 2 4,50 0 1 -0,25 1 0 1,00 4 0 4,00 7,50 12,00 9,25

NUR ÇAY 6 0 6,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 5 0 5,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 2 1 1,75 8,00 11,00 7,75

BUĞRA GÖK 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 5 3 4,25 2 3 1,25 5 1 4,75 4 6 2,50 0,00 4,25 12,75

DİLARA KARAKOÇ 13 5 11,75 2 2 1,50 1 3 0,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 13,50 14,50 1,00

ELİF ŞENYÜZ 4 3 3,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 8 4 7,00 0 0 0,00 4 1 3,75 1 1 0,75 3,25 10,25 11,50

ZEYNEP NUR AYKUR 6 0 6,00 0 1 -0,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 5 7 3,25 1 1 0,75 2 2 1,50 2 1 1,75 5,75 9,00 7,25

EMRULLAH İNCİ 12 12 9,00 4 5 2,75 1 5 -0,25 0 1 -0,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 11,25 11,50 0,00
MUHAMMET OSMAN 
DÜĞENCİ

0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 5 4 4,00 2 2 1,50 1 1 0,75 4 1 3,75 0,00 4,00 10,00

RÜMEYSA TÜRKSOY 6 2 5,50 0 1 -0,25 1 0 1,00 0 1 -0,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 1 -0,25 4 2 3,50 0 0 0,00 1 0 1,00 1 0 1,00 5,75 9,75 5,50

LEYYA HİRA BİLDİREN 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 5 4 4,00 1 1 0,75 2 2 1,50 2 1 1,75 0,00 4,00 8,00

EYÜP KAAN ÇİL 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 9 6 7,50 3 9 0,75 1 2 0,50 3 6 1,50 0,00 7,50 10,25

ŞULE POLAT 5 6 3,50 1 3 0,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 4 6 2,50 0 0 0,00 2 0 2,00 0 2 -0,50 3,75 6,25 4,00

İNCİ HALICI 5 1 4,75 0 1 -0,25 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 0 0 0,00 3 3 2,25 1 1 0,75 0 0 0,00 1 2 0,50 4,50 6,75 3,50

8,62 4,37 7,52 2,50 # 1,86 2,17 ### 1,86 1,62 ## 1,40 ## ## 1,26 0,69 0,54 0,56 ## ## 0,40 ## ## 3,57 ## ## 0,47 ## 1,65 0,89 ## ## 1,01


